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Timber Sale Tracts #4-23, #32-23, #8-24, #19-24, 
#23-24, #30-24, #36-24, #38-24 & #90-24 did not 
sell on the December 5, 2024 Clark County Forest 
timber sale bid opening.  
 
These tracts are available for direct purchase at 10% 
above minimum bid value unless otherwise agreed 
upon by the Forestry and Parks Department as per 
department policy. 
 
Contact the Clark County Forestry & Parks 
Department for more information. 
 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

TIMBER • RECREATION • WILDLIFE 



TIMBER SALE BID RESULTS November 7, 2024

CLARK COUNTY FOREST

Qualified Non-Qualified

4-23 0 0 $40,246.50 -$                       

32-23 0 0 $6,841.90 -$                       

8-24 0 0 $42,153.00 -$                       

9-24 1 0 $24,004.00 28,930.00$            

19-24 0 0 $12,712.00 -$                       

23-24 0 0 $20,667.50 -$                       

30-24 0 0 $18,665.00 -$                       

31-24 3 0 $5,929.10 10,127.70$            

32-24 6 0 $121,001.00 203,597.50$          

33-24 4 0 $39,571.80 51,780.00$            

36-24 0 1 $82,582.50 -$                       

38-24 0 0 $32,148.50 -$                       

39-24 6 0 $79,716.80 112,919.90$          

40-24 8 0 $40,275.00 82,845.00$            

42-24 5 0 $85,220.01 124,678.50$          

43-24 3 0 $24,200.00 38,300.00$            

46-24 10 0 $49,090.00 92,265.00$            

47-24 10 0 $116,918.40 199,130.00$          

48-24 5 0 $88,486.00 131,940.00$          

49-24 5 0 $38,253.20 73,230.00$            

90-24 0 0 $2,101.70 -$                       

Totals 66 1 $970,783.91 1,149,743.60$       

*lump sum

21 $712,665.31

13 1,149,743.60$       

12 61%

8

67 11,305.00

66 942

5.5 101.70$                 

496.00

41

2,318.03$              Average $ per Acre Sold 

Number of Tracts with Qualifying Bids Percent Increase Over Appraised Value

Number of Tracts with No Bids

Total Number of Bids

Total Number of Qualifying Bids

Avg. Number of Qualifying Bids Per Tract Average $ per Cord Equivalent Sold

Average Cord Equivalent/Sold Tract

Bid Value

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Kron Forest Products

No Bid

Acres Sold

Total Bid Value of Tracts Sold

Total Appraised Value of Tracts Sold

Nicholas Syryczuk

MINIMUM NOT MET

Byers Forestry

Tigerton Lumer Co

Northwest Hardwoods

Theodore Strzok Logging

Cord Equivalent Volume Sold

Average Acreage of Sold Tracts

Tract 

Number

Number of Bids

High Bidder Appraised Value

Number of Tracts Offered

Number of Tracts Receiving Bids

^storm salvage

Schreiner Forestry

No Bid

Northwest Hardwoods

No Bid

No Bid

Kron Forest Products

Byers Forestry

No Bid

TNT Timber Improvement LLC

Tigerton Lumer Co



tons cords per ton per cord per ton per cord per ton per cord

Aspen Pulp 550 244 $5.75 $12.93 $12.00 $27.00 $4.00 $9.00

Aspen Bolts 80 36 $17.00 $38.25 $20.00 $45.00 $12.00 $27.00

Oak Pulp 4530 1647 $8.08 $22.22 $16.50 $45.38 $5.00 $13.75

Oak Bolts 2100 764 $24.13 $66.37 $29.00 $79.75 $16.50 $45.38

Mixed Hardwood Pulp 1500 652 $12.16 $27.98 $16.50 $37.95 $5.00 $11.50

Tamarack 0 0 #DIV/0! #DIV/0! $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

Basswood Pulp 0 0 #DIV/0! #DIV/0! $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

Mixed Hardwood Bolts 140 61 $16.50 $37.95 $16.50 $37.95 $16.50 $37.95

Jack Pine Pulp 0 0 #DIV/0! #DIV/0! $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

Red Pine Pulp 110 49 $9.00 $20.25 $9.00 $20.25 $9.00 $20.25

White Pine Pulp 80 38 $6.19 $12.99 $6.50 $13.65 $6.00 $12.60

*Red Pine Comingled 10820 4809 $41.71 $93.84 $46.25 $104.06 $9.00 $20.25

*White Pine Comingled 1910 910 $27.28 $57.30 $46.25 $97.13 $16.00 $33.60

Red Oak Sawlog

White Oak Sawlog

Black Oak Sawlog

Red Maple Sawlog

Sugar Maple Sawlog

Mixed Hardwood Sawlog

Red Pine Sawlogs

White Pine Sawlogs

*Includes Pine Bolts Sold

6 $143.33 $150.00 $130.00

5 $120.00 $120.00 $120.00

10 $350.00 $350.00 $350.00

0 #DIV/0! $0.00 $0.00

24 $450.00 $450.00 $450.00

0 #DIV/0! $0.00 $0.00

mbfmbf

196 $734.22 $905.00 $400.00

 AVERAGE SUCCESSFUL BIDS – As of November 7, 2024

Clark County Forest

Species/Type
Volume Weighted Average High Low

mbfmbf

710 $525.15 $590.00 $275.00
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